
Clinton County, State of Iowa

Official Ballot
City/School Election

November 5, 2019

INSTRUCTIONS TO VOTER

1. Voting Mark. To vote, fill in the
oval next to your choice.

 Candidate Name
 Candidate Name

2. Write-in Votes. To vote for a
person whose name is not on the
ballot, write the name on the write-in
line below the list of candidates and
fill in the oval next to it.
3. Use only the pen or pencil
provided.
4. Do not cross out. If you change
your mind, exchange your ballot for
a new one.

DIRECTOR DISTRICT 4 _____Precinct Official's Initials Typ:01 Seq:0028 Spl:01

OFFICIAL CITY/SCHOOL ELECTION BALLOT

CALAMUS- WHEATLAND SCHOOL - 4

CAL-WHEAT DIRECTOR-AT-LARGE
VOTE FOR NO MORE THAN ONE

Larry J. Banowetz

(Write-in vote, if any)

CAL-WHEAT DIRECTOR
DISTRICT 4

VOTE FOR NO MORE THAN ONE

James Knoche

(Write-in vote, if any)

EASTERN IOWA COMMUNITY
COLLEGE DIRECTOR

DISTRICT V
VOTE FOR NO MORE THAN ONE

Bill Vetter

(Write-in vote, if any)

Notice to voters. To vote to approve
any question on this ballot, fill in the
oval in front of the word "Yes". To
vote against any question, fill in the
oval in front of the word "No".

Public Measure FC

SHALL THE FOLLOWING PUBLIC
MEASURE BE ADOPTED?

Shall the Board of Directors of the
Calamus-Wheatland Community
School District in the Counties of
Clinton and Scott, State of Iowa, be
authorized for a period of ten (10)
years, to levy annually, as determined
by the Board, a voter-approved
physical plant and equipment property
tax not to exceed sixty-seven cents
(67¢) per one thousand dollars
($1,000) of the assessed valuation of
the taxable property within the school
district commencing with the levy for
collection in the fiscal year
commencing on July 1, 2021, to be
used for any purpose or purposes
now or hereafter authorized by Iowa
law?

Yes

No
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